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Sarah McCulloch
18th July 2012

Dear Sarah McCulloch,
FREEDOM OF INFORMATION ACT 2000 – Dudley PCT - Ref: FOI/000212 – Autistic Spectrum Disorder
Thank you for your request received 22nd June 2012. You asked for information regarding Autistic Spectrum Disorder.
Your request for information has now been considered. I will answer your queries below in turn:

1. How many adults you have with a diagnosis of autistic spectrum disorder (any, although if there are separate statistics for Asperger's, HFA, LFA, they would be appreciated) in your area;

Information not held.

2. How many children;

Information not held.

3. What diagnostic services are available to a) adults and b) children;

Specialist services which are provided by Birmingham and Solihull Mental Health Services Trust. To send your request to them, please see the ‘Contact Us’ section of their web site: http://www.bsmhft.nhs.uk/contact-us/.

4. What agencies or teams you have that work with autistic people, provide support/services, strategise, etc. 

5. An email address/website for each of these agencies or teams where possible.
Dudley Metropolitan Borough Council Adult Services would be able to provide an answer for these questions. To send your request to them, you can either send it online via the following link: https://www.dudleyfoi.org.uk/feedback/feedback.asp, or send it in writing to:

The Data Protection Officer
Dudley MBC
Finance Department
Council House
Dudley
West Midlands
DY1 1HF

6. What the typical process should be for an adult in your area first asking their GP for an assessment for autistic spectrum disorder to receiving a diagnosis/support.

Referral would normally be made by the GP to Birmingham and Solihull. Any subsequent approval of funding required would be sought from Dudley Clinical Commissioning Group (CCG).
Please send your request to Birmingham and Solihull Mental Health Services Trust. To send your request to them, please see the ‘Contact Us’ section of their web site: http://www.bsmhft.nhs.uk/contact-us/.
If you have any queries or concerns then please contact me.

If you are dissatisfied with the handling of your request please contact the Head of Records and Information Governance at Dudley PCT, St John’s House, Union Street, Dudley DY2 8PP or telephone 01384 321713 or email donna.dallaway@dudley.nhs.uk.

You can also refer to the Information Commissioner at:

Information Commissioner’s Office

Wycliffe House

Water Lane

Wilmslow

Cheshire

SK9 5AF

Telephone: 01625 545700  
www.informationcommissioner.gov.uk
Yours sincerely
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Paul Couldrey

Associate Director of Governance

This information has been collated by our Freedom of Information Team if you require names from within the organisation to attribute this information to i.e. for media quotes please contact the Communications Team on: 01384 322060.
